
Alex 
“In the land of the blind, the one-eyed man is king.” 

History 
Mary, Billy and Jane are your former schoolmates. You are all linked together by an event 
that took place five years ago during a school trip. You and Billy got drunk and started 
pouring booze into Mary, Jane's best friend, as well. You wanted Mary badly. It was mainly 
the fact that she was the only one in the class who had not yet succumbed to your charm 
and just laughed at you. That made you want her even more. It was not that you found her 
so attractive, but the insulted ego increased the desire. Five years ago, you got her drunk 
and had sex with her. And after you, Billy did as well. He wouldn't do it by himself, but he 
idolizes you and you kept provoking him. Furthermore, Billy was in love with Jane at the time 
and totally hammered. You two raped Mary.  
 
When you discovered Billy didn't remember anything in the morning, you decided to keep 
him in the dark and you told him you talked Mary into having sex with you. Billy thinks he 
didn't even touch Mary. You deeply enjoyed the intoxicating feeling that you managed to hurt 
Mary, manipulate Billy to rape her as well and finally end up lying to him about it. That feeling 
of dominance over him entertains you. 

Character 
You are a self-conscious weakling with zero self-confidence, but you conceal it well. You act 
like a jock and macho on the outside. 
You are the type of person who surrounds themselves with incompetent people to shine by 
contrast. 
 
You are a selfish spoiled piece of shit who is used to getting your way every time. Your 
parents gave you everything. Trendy clothes, state-of-the-art gadgets, a car... everything 
except for their love. It is easy for you to pick up girls, but you only talk about yourself with 
them because you are incapable of having honest interest in others. The only thing that 
interests you about other people is what can you get from them. It is always you to end a 
relationship because girls are not good enough for you. You have had really great sex only 
once in your life, and it was probably the last as well. 
 
You have always gotten everything you wanted. However, you have never experienced 
acceptance or genuine interest and understanding from another human being. That created 
a deep void and the only way you know how to fill it is by buying the largest and most 
expensive "toys". 



Relationships with Other Characters 
Billy​ was your best friend in high school. He was even weaker than you and that is why you 
chose him. Your confident behavior made you look like a king compared to Billy. And you 
solidified this position by constantly berating him. You learned by accident that Billy has a 
brother who suffers from dementia and Crohn's disease (a type of inflammatory bowel 
disease causing bloody diarrhea) at the same time - this combination causes Billy's brother 
to shit his pants frequently. 
 

"You are so stupid you can't even take a proper shit, just like your brother!" 
 

You use this sentence to humiliate, provoke and berate Billy. In the past, you provoked him 
to rape Mary with it. ​You should say it several times tonight as well. But do not be wasteful 
with it. Wait for the moment it's going to hurt the most. 
 
You are not interested in Jane, but you keep flirting with her anyway because you know Billy 
likes her. And it makes you feel good to provoke him like that. You had your fun with Jane 
already. 
 
You want Mary. It was the best sex you've ever had.  You were all so drunk back then. She 
might not remember it, she might have blanked out drunk, just like Billy. Find out what she 
remembers about that night. If she doesn't resent you for that rape, don't lose time and hit on 
her. 
 


